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WonderWorks Destiny Celebrating Teacher Appreciation Days with Free 
Admission for Local Educators 

  
SYRACUSE, New York – (May 6, 2024) – Nationally, Teacher Appreciation Week is 
recognized during the first full week of May – this year from May 6-10th, 2024. To 
celebrate local educators and spread appreciation for their hard work, WonderWorks 
Destiny is offering free admission for all teachers and educational support staff 
throughout the entire month of May. Educators can register online for their printable 
voucher to score free tickets, plus up to four additional guests receiving half off 
admission. WonderWorks is the perfect place to celebrate the end of the school year 
and keep the learning going all summer long. 
 
“Educators make the world go ‘round! Teacher Appreciation Days are back at 
WonderWorks this month, and our team can’t wait to honor all the amazing teachers 
and school staff in our community. Sign up for your free admission voucher today!” said 
Paige Perry, education sales manager at WonderWorks Destiny.  
 
During May 2024, teachers and school support staff can take advantage of this event to 
explore everything the upside-down lab has to offer for free. The admission gives them 
access to all the hands-on science, technology, engineering, art, and mathematics 
(STEAM) focused exhibits, a challenging ropes course, laser tag, the 4D XD motion 
theater, and more. Up to four additional guests visiting with the guest of honor can get 
half off their admission ticket, making it the perfect day out with the family. This annual 
appreciation special is open to all current teachers and educational support staff. 
Educators must register online to receive their discount voucher to turn in upon arrival to 
redeem their free ticket and score the discounted rate for guests. A valid school ID or a 
recent pay stub must also be presented upon entrance.  
 
“Teachers, we know you’re working hard as we inch closer to the end of the school 
year, so come enjoy a day of fun at WonderWorks,” said Jon Cascella, general 
manager at WonderWorks Destiny. “This event is one of our favorites to host every year 
and is a way to extend our appreciation for all you do!”  
 
Education and fun go hand in hand at WonderWorks, so it’s the perfect place to keep 
learning going all summer long. Not only do the exhibits inside encourage learning, but 
they also give guests an exciting, memorable way to do so. Guests are sure to enjoy 
exploring the exhibits, challenging themselves, creating memories, and trying new 
things. Science fans will also want to stop by to check out the latest additions to the 
WonderWorks exhibits, Soarin’ Soles, where they can get their feet moving, and I 
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THINK Therefore I STEM, to learn about what it’s like to be a marine biologist. Families 
can also keep the learning going at home with printable Kids Corner Activity sheets.  
 
Looking to get the most bang for your buck? WonderWorks Destiny offers an annual 
pass, a discounted way to keep the fun going all year round. The WonderWorks Annual 
Pass includes unlimited admission to the WonderWorks exhibits and the Canyon Climb 
Ropes Course for one year. More information about the annual pass can be found 
online.  
 
WonderWorks Destiny offers a variety of educational programs and promotions 
throughout the year for local students and families to enjoy. It also offers group rates, 
scouting programs, homeschool days, Science Week, and corporate events. For more 
information, visit the site at: https://www.wonderworksonline.com/destiny. 
  
About WonderWorks 
WonderWorks, a science-focused indoor amusement park, combines education and 
entertainment into one venue. With over 100 hands-on exhibits, there is something 
unique and challenging for all ages. Feel the power of 71 mph hurricane-force winds in 
the Hurricane Shack. Make life-sized bubbles in the Bubble Lab. Get the NASA 
treatment and experience zero gravity in our Astronaut Training Gyro. Nail it by lying on 
the death-defying Bed of Nails. WonderWorks is in Orlando, Pigeon Forge, Panama 
City Beach, Myrtle Beach, Syracuse, and Branson. Visit 
WonderWorksonline.com/destiny and follow @WonderWorksDestiny on Facebook, 
@WonderWorksDUSA on Twitter, and @WonderWorks_dusa on Instagram. 
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